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SPARK249 
(Matrix Code: SPARK249.00 for the StartOver.xyz thoughtware upgrade game.) 
 
DISTINCTION: Archetypal forces of nature want you to succeed. 
 
NOTES: How is it possible that Archetypal forces of nature want you to succeed? What 
is an ‘Archetypal force of nature’, anyway? Decades of personal at-risk empirical 
research prepared us to be able to ask this question. It surprised us when it arrived.  
 
We discovered the question backwards, by learning to feel first. This explanation will 
be given to you forwards, from general to specific. It goes like this: The General Field 
of Consciousness is everywhere. If you spin Consciousness, you create subatomic 
particles. Clouds of hydrogen atoms swirl into galaxies and solar systems. Stars ignite, 
fusing hydrogen into heavier elements, and planets form. Suddenly there is something 
to interact with the General Field of Consciousness. The interaction between solid 
matter and the General Field of Consciousness creates a new field, the ‘Local Field of 
Consciousness’. The Local Field of Consciousness of planet Earth is Gaia.  
 
Gaia influences the stepwise evolution of matter on Earth until certain structures spring 
to life. Human Beings are a material structure that has evolved enough complexity and 
fluidity to catch enough Consciousness for self-reflection, that is, to be aware of 
awareness and of being aware. Now the General Field of Consciousness is no longer 
alone. It has something to talk to which is potentially capable of talking back.  
 
Each Human Being directly interacts with both the General Field of Consciousness 
AND the Specific Field of Consciousness. This is why humans invented both 
monotheistic and polytheistic belief systems. Both belief systems are correct. Both 
belief systems are irrelevant. They are irrelevant because belief is irrelevant when 
direct experience is possible. The fact that Human Beings fight about who is ‘right’ 
simply reveals the degree to which we are uninitiated on the adulthood Path.  
 
As Possibility Management evolved thoughtmaps for navigating both feelings and 
emotions, we proceeded to implement 3 Phase Healing and the distinction-rich 
Emotional Healing Processes (EHP) of Possibility Coaching. By delivering authentic 
adulthood initiatory processes in Expand The Box training and Possibility Labs, 
startling new potentials began to reveal themselves. We were suddenly interacting 
directly with the Archetypal forces of nature in the Universe. Archetypal Love began 
accompanying us in properly contexted training and meeting spaces. We started giving 
the additional forces names so we could deepen our connections with them: 

 Bright Principles are facets of the General Field of Consciousness.  
 Radical Responsibility is applied Consciousness, or Consciousness in action. 
 Archetypal Love is Consciousness of Consciousness in a Space. 
 Nothingness is available in your middle. You sense it when standing in front of 

the refrigerator with the door open, looking for something to fill your inner void, 
but nothing in there will do it. Fortunately! You need an inner resource of 
Nothingness for creation. 

 Archetypal Lineage is your personal infinite source for your most ecstatic work. 
 Earth Coincidence Control Office (E.C.C.O.) is Earth’s global nonlinear 

collaboration engine lining up resources and possibilities in your favor. 
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All of these Archetypal forces of nature are Infinite Resources, very different from the 
material resources of Earth, which are being consumed and turned into toxic waste by 
modern culture – the more they are used, the less remain. Archetypal resources 
function completely differently. The more they are used, the bigger they get.  
 
Why do the Archetypal forces of nature want you to succeed at becoming the space 
through which they can do their work in the world? The reason is simple: Archetypal 
forces do not have eyes, hands, feet, or a voice. Archetypal forces of nature ache to 
offer their treasures to Human Beings on Earth because we are designed in their 
image! We are able to use their treasures. But the Archetypal forces cannot manifest 
except through a human interface between them and other humans. This is why the 
Forces want Possibilitators to succeed! The Archetypal Forces can be most alive 
through your healing and evolution work with other Humans. Imagine the ecstasy of 
working with Archetypal forces at your back in your daily life. Are you ready to try it? 
 
EXPERIMENTS:  
SPARK249.01 SHIFT TO EXPERIENTIAL REALITY SO AS TO SPEAK IN THE 
ARCHETYPAL LANGUAGE The world that exists is much larger than the world for 
which you have words. Your Verbal Reality prison blocks you from entering a wider 
world. Study the Experiential Reality website and do all the Experiments there. 
Discover how to enter the Nothingness inside of you, and practice floating there 
gleefully. Your personal Nothingness is the same Nothingness as in the Gap between 
Spaces. Once you feel at home talking with other people while you are centered in the 
Nothingness, it will be quite easy for you to learn to Speak From The Unknown. Follow 
the instructions. Do the Experiments. Practice often in your Possibility Team meetings.  
SPARK249.02 LEARN TO CONSCIOUSLY FEEL SO AS TO SPEAK IN THE 
ARCHETYPAL LANGUAGE By shifting to Experiential Reality and learning to 
consciously feel, you can send and receive information and directly exchange impulses 
with the Archetypal forces of nature! This is the value of learning to consciously feel! 
To inner navigate and communicate your feelings and emotions, read the entire book 
Conscious Feelings by Clinton Callahan. Do all the Experiments as you read along. 
This is more easily and productively done in a formal weekly or twice-a-week Study 
Group. Learn to inner navigate your feelings until you can freely let your heart speak. 
A wonderfully supported space to learn to let your heart speak is Heart Gym. Arrange 
to regularly attend 6 months of Heart Gym while you also do the 3-3-3 exercise on your 
own. After these 6 months, the world will work differently for you.  
SPARK249.03 NOTICE BOTH THE GENERAL AND THE LOCAL FIELDS OF 
CONSCIOUSNESS After doing both the first and second Experiments above, arrange 
with a partner to take walks in nature. Find places to sit and close your eyes. Take 
turns connecting with and reporting your experiences of both the General Field of 
Consciousness, and the Specific Field of Consciousness of Earth, which is Gaia. 
Practice this until you can experientially distinguish which Field of Consciousness you 
are interacting with. Report in detail to your Possibility Team about your discoveries. 
SPARK249.04 TALK WITH GAIA – ASK PRACTICAL QUESTIONS OF TRUE 
NECESSITY AND IMPLEMENT THE ANSWERS Proceed as in the previous 
Experiment, but this time connect specifically with the Local Field of Consciousness of 
Earth – Gaia. Come prepared with one Beep Book! page filled with important questions 
for yourself or for your Team. Write down exactly what Gaia answers to you. If you do 
not understand, write the answers first, word-for-word, then say, “Gaia, I did not 
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understand. Would you please say it in a different way? Please give me more 
examples.” Report back to your Possibility Team about your conversations. 
SPARK249.05 DISTILL YOUR BRIGHT PRINCIPLES Follow the instructions from 
Chapter 8 of the Conscious Feelings book, or go to the Bright Principles website, and 
proceed to distill your Bright Principles from your life. After you write answers to the 30 
questions, after you distill your answers down to 3, 4, 5, or 6 Bright Principles, please 
have them checked by a Possibility Management Trainer. You need at least one Sword 
Principle, one Heart Principle, and one Soul Principle to have a working set. After this, 
if you want, the Trainer can hold space for you to choose to serve your Bright Principles 
and become your destiny in action. This choice is optional. Most Human Beings never 
choose to serve their Bright Principles. If you choose that, when you look in the mirror 
or see your reflection, you do not see your ordinary personality anymore. What you 
see is the space through which your Bright Principles can do their work in the world. It 
is amazing to experience your life as an activated set of Archetypal forces. 
SPARK249.06 ASK YOUR ARCHETYPAL LINEAGE FOR YOUR NEXT STEP TO 
PREPARE TO JACK-IN At first, authentic adulthood initiatory processes focus on 
preparing you to jack-in to your Archetypal Lineage. To understand more about 
Archetypal Lineage, study the Archetypal Lineage and 4 Lineages websites with your 
Team, and do all the Experiments together. It takes years of preparation to build the 
Matrix and attain the level of agency in Reality needed to jack-in to your Archetypal 
Lineage. Why? Look at it from the Archetypal Lineage’s perspective. If you jack-in and 
your Archetypal Lineage gives you a job to do, such as, call this thought leader, 
contribute $13,000 to this project, write this book… etc. and you do not have the 
wherewithal to immediately accomplish the job, then the next job comes down the tube, 
and the next, and the tube is already jammed up with your incomplete jobs. It is a mess. 
However… now that you have learned the archetypal language of intuitive impulses 
and very low-level feelings, you can, starting now, communicate with your Archetypal 
Lineage. The most valuable approach that we have found is, from time to time, sit down 
with your Beep! Book, close your eyes, ask to talk with a representative of your 
Archetypal Lineage, click your Clicker, and after saying, “Hello,” then say, “Please tell 
me what is my best next step to prepare myself to jack-in to my Archetypal Lineage.” 
Write down exactly what they say. Then say, “Thank you.” Click your Clicker again, so 
they are gone. Do the preparation specified, completely and well. Then ask again.  
SPARK249.07 BRING A TEAM TOGETHER SO YOU CAN ALL BE YOUR BRIGHT 
PRINCIPLES AND ARCHETYPAL LINEAGES IN ACTION Trying to work a corporate 
job, rent a room in a house owned by a modern culture landlord, raise a child attending 
public school, pay taxes and insurance, the whole catastrophe, is such a burden while 
trying to become an agent of Archetypal Forces. We recommend bringing together a 
Team of Possibilitators for your expedition. It can be empowering to formulate your 
Team as a Gaian gameworld that you create and thrive in together. Learn to build a 
gameworld from its context to its codex. It could be a Bridgehouse, an Archiarchy 
Invention Center (AIC), a Training or Initiation Center, a Nanonation, or a new kind of 
nonmaterial-value initiation-centered radically-responsible Archan gameworld that 
hasn’t been invented yet. (Remember, this is still the birthing of Archiarchy…) Help 
each person learn the Archetypal language, achieve Radical Freedom, distill their 
Bright Principles, transform their Gremlin, and decontaminate their adult egostate. 
Greet them in the morning as their Bright Principles. Consider adopting other Archan 
gameworld traditions. Have Fun! 
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